
$450,000 - 434 Horseshoe Loop, Jemez Springs
MLS® #202504028 

$450,000
2 Bedroom, 2.00 Bathroom, 1,733 sqft
Residential on 0.79 Acres

N/A, Jemez Springs, NM

Heaven in Horseshoe Springs! Surrounded by
soaring pines & crisp mountain air, this
beautifully remodeled cabin blends rustic
charm with modern comfort. Natural knotty
pine walls pair perfectly with wood flooring, & a
country kitchen that is cute as a button! Two
inviting living areas, each with its own
woodstove (including a Blaze King), along with
2 bedrooms, 2 bathrooms, & a spacious loft.
Soaring ceilings & abundant natural light, this
cabin has room for everyone! Outdoor living
shines with a covered porch in front and a
sunny deck out back. A community water
system and well-managed HOA keep life
simple, with roads maintained year-round.
Bordering common lands with trail leading to
San Antonio Creek & endless recreation all
around, this cabin is waiting for your mountain
memories!

Built in 1973

Listing Details

Listing Agent Misty R. Stacy

Listing Office Jemez Homes and Land, LLC

Essential Information

MLS® # 202504028

Price $450,000

Bedrooms 2

Bathrooms 2.00

Full Baths 1



Square Footage 1,733

Square Footage 1733 SquareFeet

Acres 0.79

Year Built 1973

Type Residential

Sub-Type Single Family Residence

Status Closed

Community Information

Address 434 Horseshoe Loop

Area 50-Jemez

Subdivision N/A

City Jemez Springs

County Sandoval

State NM

Zip Code 87025

Amenities

Utilities Electricity Available

Parking Spaces 5

Interior

Interior Features Interior Steps

Heating Electric, Propane, Wood Stove

Cooling None

Fireplace Yes

# of Fireplaces 2

Fireplaces Wood Burning, Wood Burning Stove

Stories One

Exterior

Roof Metal

School Information

Elementary Jemez Springs

Middle Jemez Valley Middle

High Jemez Valley High

Additional Information



Date Listed August 26th, 2025

Days on Market 1

HOA Fees 600

HOA Fees Freq. Annually
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